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Rice Pudding 
       

 
 

  

       
 
 
     18% calories from fat 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Ingredients Instructions 

2 cups cooked, white rice 
 
3 cups 1% milk 
 
¼ cup sugar 
 
¼ teaspoon salt 
 
1/3 cup raisins 
 
1 egg, slightly beaten 
 
1 Tablespoon butter 
 
1 teaspoon vanilla extract 
 
 
 
 
Makes 6 servings 
 
Notes: 
• Substitute 1 cup instant 
nonfat dry milk powder 
and 3 cups of water in 
place of low fat milk. 
 
• For added nutrition 
substitute cooked brown 
rice for cooked white rice. 

1. Use leftover rice or cook 1 
cup of dry rice ahead of 
time. 
 

2. In a medium saucepan, 
combine cooked rice, milk, 
sugar, salt, and raisins; 
bring to a light boil, and 
then reduce heat, cooking 
over medium low heat 
until thick and creamy, 
about 20-25 minutes, 
stirring often. 

 
3. In a small dish beat egg 

thoroughly then add to 
saucepan mixture while 
stirring and cook for 5 
more minutes stirring 
occasionally. Do not boil, 
but mixture must reach 
160° F degrees. 

 
4. Remove saucepan from 

heat, stir in butter and 
vanilla. 

 
5. Pour into a serving dish or 

individual dishes. Serve 
warm or refrigerate and 
serve cold. 
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